Purchasing Division
CITY OF INDIANAPOLIS

Written Quote Tabulation

ITB No. and Description ITB0006813 Opening Date: Dept. Contact Name Reviewed By
Two-Year Contract for Protective Safety Gloves for 8/15/07 Ellen Parker 3272322 | Jennifer Roberts
the Department of Public Works John Yearwood 327-2913 | 317-327-3940
Camacho Cintas Corp. GM Supply Global Interstate Milor Supply Supply U.S. Safety W. W.
Equipment & Company Industrial Lumber & Specialty Depot Grainger,
Janitorial Supply Hardware LLC Inc.
Supply Inc. Company
ltem 1 NO BID 2,460.00 2,930.00 1,995.00 2,720.00 2,890.00 NO BID 3,600.00 2,790.00
Big Jake Gloves
ltem 2 6,885.00 4,437.00 4,743.00 6,885.00 8,415.00 4,590.00 15,147.00 4,131.00 6,885.00
Brown Jersey
Gloves
ltem 3 160.00 880.00 13,440.00 156.00 212.00 129.20 200.00 120.00 222.40
Disposable Vinyl
Gloves
ltem 4 14,658.00 10,710.00 4,704.00 4,662.00 7,014.00 3,696.00 NO BID 4,032.00 2,982.00
Men's Leather
Palm Gloves
ltem 5 3,354.00 2,262.00 2,678.00 10,270.00 3,744.00 6,708.00 NO BID 2,938.00 2,678.00
Orange/Black
Fireball Gloves
ltem 6 2,592.00 4,248.00 4,824.00 9,504.00 10,584.00 3,744.00 8,568.00 3,096.00 8,568.00
String Knit
Gloves
ltem 7 3,086.00 992.00 | 1,134.00 (M, L) 1,200.00 1,866.00 884.00 NO BID 840.00 1,008.00
Winter Gloves 1,156.00 (XL)
1,208.00 (XXL)
ltem 8 38.40 39.84 48.00 53.28 156.00 39.84 NO BID 43.68 33.12
Women'’s
Leather Palm
Gloves

Bids Deemed Non-Responsive Due to Failure to Submit Addendums 1 and 2:

BKW Environmental

H.P. Products
Bid Deemed Non-Responsive Due to Failure to Submit Signed Bid Form:

Quest Environmental & Safety Products
Barrett Supplies & Equipment

TCl Industrial Supply, LTD

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.

Universal Tool & Supply




